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Contract Information Sheet
Vendor name: Ameri Gas Propane

Contract Information

Statewide Contract Number

SWC90810

PeopleSoft Vendor Number

0000005113

Vendor Name & Address

Ameri Gas Propane
PO Box 965
Valley Forge, PA 19482

Contract Administrator

Stevenson Dawn
Telephone: 610-768-3601
Fax: 610-768-7694

Contract Details

Ordering Information

Ameri Gas Propane
460 N. Gulph Road
King of Prussia, PA 19406

Remitting Information

Ameri Gas Propane
460 N. Gulph Road
King of Prussia, PA 19406

Delivery Days

Orders will be shipped within 2
days after receipt of Purchase
Order

Discounts

Bid offer does not include cash
discount

Payment Terms

Net 30 Days

Bid Offer includes

State and Local Government

Acceptable payment method

Vendor will accept Purchase
Orders and the Purchasing Card
under this contract as permitted
by current policies governing the
Purchasing Card program.



mailto: Henise.Jane@amerigas.com

Contract Information Sheet
Vendor name: Ferrellgas, L.P.

Contract Information

Statewide Contract Number

SWC90810

PeopleSoft Vendor Number

0000016984

Vendor Name & Address

Ferrellgas, L.P.
7500 College Blvd., Suite 1000

Overland Park, Kansas 66210-4098

Contract Administrator

Vicki Garcia
Telephone: 913-661-1574

Toll Free Telephone: 1-800-816-3058

Fax: 913-661-1581

Contract Details

Ordering Information

Ferrellgas, L.P.

7500 College Blvd., Suite 1000
Overland Park, Kansas 66210-
4098

Remitting Information

Ferrellgas, L.P.

7500 College Blvd., Suite 1000
Overland Park, Kansas 66210-
4098

Delivery Days

Orders will be shipped within 2
days after receipt of Purchase
Order

Discounts

Bid offer does not include cash
discount

Payment Terms

Net 30 Days

Bid Offer includes

State and Local Government

Acceptable payment method

Vendor will accept Purchase
Orders and the Purchasing Card
under this contract as permitted
by current policies governing the
Purchasing Card program.



mailto:VickiGarcia@ferrellgas.com

Contract Information Sheet
Vendor name: Blossman Gas, Inc.

Contract Information

Statewide Contract Number

SWC90810

PeopleSoft Vendor Number

0000030655

Vendor Name & Address

Blossman Gas, Inc.

809 Washington Avenue
Ocean Springs, MS 39564

P.O. Box 1110

Ocean Springs, MS 39566-1110

Contract Administrator

Carmen Mee

Direct Ph: 228-872-8902

Fax: 228-875-9307

Email: Carmen.mee@blossmangas.com

Contract Details

Ordering Information

809 Washington Ave. Ocean Springs, MS
39564

Remitting Information

Each Service Location per Location

Delivery Days

Orders will be shipped within 2
days after receipt of Purchase
Order

Discounts

Bid offer does not include cash
discount

Payment Terms

Net 30 Days

Bid Offer includes

State and Local Government

Acceptable payment method

Vendor will accept Purchase
Orders and the Purchasing Card
under this contract as permitted
by current policies governing the
Purchasing Card program.
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mailto: Carmen.mee@blossmangas.com

Region 1 Region 2 Region 3
Bartow Floyd Paulding Banks Habersham | Rabun Cherokee | DeKalb Fulton
Catoosa Gilmer Pickens Dawson Hall Stephens Clayton Douglas Gwinnett
Chattooga | Gordon Polk Forsyth Hart Towns Cobb Fayette Henry
Dade Haralson Walker Franklin Lumpkin Union Rockdale
Fannin Murray Whitfield White
Region 4 Region 5 Region 6
Butts Heard Spalding Barrow Jackson Newton Baldwin Houston Pulaski
Carroll Lamar Troup Clarke Jasper Oconee Bibb Jones Putnam
Coweta Meriwether | Upson Elbert Madison Oglethorpe | Crawford | Monroe Twiggs

Pike Greene Morgan Walton Peach Wilkinson
Region 7 Region 8 Region 9
Burke Jefferson Screven Chattahoochee | Macon Schley Appling Evans Telfair
Columbia | Jenkins Taliafero Clay Marion Stewart Bleckley Jeff Davis Toombs
Glascock Lincoln Warren Crisp Muscogee Sumter Candler Johnson Treutlen
Hancock McDuffie Washington | Dooly Quitman Talbot Dodge Laurens Wayne

Richmond Wilkes Harris Randolph Taylor Emanuel Montgomery | Wheeler

Webster Tattnall Wilcox

Region 10 Region 11 Region 12
Baker Dougherty | Mitchell Atkinson Charlton Lanier Bryan Chatham Liberty
Calhoun Early Seminole Bacon Clinch Lowndes Bulloch Effingham Long
Colquitt Grady Terrell Ben Hill Coffee Pierce Camden Glynn McIntosh
Decatur Lee Thomas Berrien Cook Tift

Miller Worth Brantley Echols Turner

Brooks Irwin Ware
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County

Bartow
Catoosa
Chattooga
Dade
Fannin
Floyd
Gilmer
Gordon
Murray
Pickens
Polk
Whitfield
Banks
Dawson
Franklin
Lumpkin
Rabun
Towns
Union
White
Cobb
Dekalb
Fulton
Gwinnett
Butts
Lamar
Pike
Upson
Barrow
Clarke
Elbert
Jasper
Morgan
Newton
Oglethorpe
Walton
Bibb
Crawford
Houston
Jones
Peach
Putnam
Twiggs
Wilkinson
Burke
Columbia
Jenkins
Lincoln
Screven
Taliafero
Chattahoochee
Harris
Marion
Muscogee
Quitman
Randolph
Schley
Stewart
Taylor
Appling
Candler
Dodge
Evans
Laurens
Montgomery
Tattnall
Telfair
Toombs
Treutlen

Branch Location

Chattanooga
Chattanooga
Chattanooga
Chattanooga
Chattanooga
Chattanooga
Chattanooga
Atlanta
Chattanooga
Chattanooga
Atlanta
Chattanooga
Atlanta
Atlanta
Atlanta
Atlanta
Atlanta
Chattanooga
Chattanooga
Atlanta
Atlanta
Atlanta
Atlanta
Atlanta
Butler GA
Butler GA
Butler GA
Butler GA
Atlanta
Atlanta
Atlanta
Atlanta
Atlanta
Atlanta
Atlanta
Atlanta
Macon, Ga
Butler GA
Macon, Ga
Macon, Ga
Butler GA
Milledgeville, Ga
Macon, Ga
Macon, Ga
Augusta, Ga.
Augusta, Ga.
Augusta, Ga.
Augusta, Ga.
Augusta, Ga.
Augusta, Ga.
Atlanta
Butler GA
Butler GA
Butler GA
Butler GA
Butler GA
Butler GA
Butler GA
Butler GA
Vidalia, Ga.
Augusta, Ga.
Vidalia, Ga.
Augusta, Ga.
East Dublin, Ga
Vidalia, Ga.
Augusta, Ga.
Vidalia, Ga.
Vidalia, Ga.
Vidalia, Ga.

Ferrell Gas Branches

Branch Manager

Cass Chandler
Cass Chandler
Cass Chandler
Cass Chandler
Cass Chandler
Cass Chandler
Cass Chandler
Kevin Tobolski
Cass Chandler
Cass Chandler
Kevin Tobolski
Cass Chandler
Kevin Tobolski
Kevin Tobolski
Kevin Tobolski
Kevin Tobolski
Kevin Tobolski
Cass Chandler
Cass Chandler
Kevin Tobolski
Kevin Tobolski
Kevin Tobolski
Kevin Tobolski
Kevin Tobolski
Darrie Hart
Darrie Hart
Darrie Hart
Darrie Hart
Kevin Tobolski
Kevin Tobolski
Kevin Tobolski
Kevin Tobolski
Kevin Tobolski
Kevin Tobolski
Kevin Tobolski
Kevin Tobolski
Joe Richardson
Darrie Hart

Joe Richardson
Joe Richardson
Darrie Hart

Joe Richardson
Joe Richardson
Joe Richardson
Marcin Grucela
Marcin Grucela
Marcin Grucela
Marcin Grucela
Marcin Grucela
Marcin Grucela
Kevin Tobolski
Darrie Hart
Darrie Hart
Darrie Hart
Darrie Hart
Darrie Hart
Darrie Hart
Darrie Hart
Darrie Hart

J. D. Bain
Marcin Grucela
J. D. Bain
Marcin Grucela
Joe Richardson
J. D. Bain
Marcin Grucela
J. D. Bain

J. D. Bain

J. D. Bain

Phone

334)202-5641
334)202-5641
334)202-5641
334)202-5641
334)202-5641
334)202-5642
334)202-5641
404)363-1300
334)202-5641
334)202-5641
404)363-1300
334)202-5641
404)363-1300
404)363-1300
404)363-1301
404)363-1302
404)363-1303
334)202-5641
334)202-5641
404)363-1300
404)363-1300
404)363-1301
404)363-1302
404)363-1300
888-862-5431
888-862-5431
888-862-5431
888-862-5431
404)363-1301
404)363-1302
404)363-1300
404)363-1301
404)363-1300
404)363-1301
404)363-1301
404)363-1300
1-866-871-3730
888-862-5431
1-866-871-3730
1-866-871-3730
888-862-5431
1-866-871-3730
1-866-871-3730
1-866-871-3730
800-282-1022
800-282-1022
800-282-1022
800-282-1022
800-282-1022
800-282-1022
(404)363-1300
888-862-5431
888-862-5431
888-862-5431
888-862-5431
888-862-5431
888-862-5431
888-862-5431
888-862-5431
800-992-4804
800-282-1022
800992-4804
800-282-1022
1-866-871-3730
800-992-4804
800-282-1022
800-992-4804
800-992-4804
800-992-4804
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Address

1411 E 41st Street, Chattanooga, TN 37407
1411 E 41st Street, Chattanooga, TN 37407
1411 E 41st Street, Chattanooga, TN 37407
1411 E 41st Street, Chattanooga, TN 37407
1411 E 41st Street, Chattanooga, TN 37407
1412 E 41st Street, Chattanooga, TN 37407
1411 E 41st Street, Chattanooga, TN 37407
3526 Moreland Avenue, Conley, GA 30288
1411 E 41st Street, Chattanooga, TN 37407
1411 E 41st Street, Chattanooga, TN 37407
3526 Moreland Avenue, Conley, GA 30288
1411 E 41st Street, Chattanooga, TN 37407
3526 Moreland Avenue, Conley, GA 30288
3526 Moreland Avenue, Conley, GA 30288
3527 Moreland Avenue, Conley, GA 30288
3528 Moreland Avenue, Conley, GA 30288
3529 Moreland Avenue, Conley, GA 30288
1411 E 41st Street, Chattanooga, TN 37407
1411 E 41st Street, Chattanooga, TN 37407
3526 Moreland Avenue, Conley, GA 30288
3526 Moreland Avenue, Conley, GA 30288
3527 Moreland Avenue, Conley, GA 30288
3528 Moreland Avenue, Conley, GA 30288
3526 Moreland Avenue, Conley, GA 30288
P.O. Box 485 Butler, GA 31006

P.O. Box 485 Butler, GA 31006

P.O. Box 485 Butler, GA 31006

P.O. Box 485 Butler, GA 31006

3527 Moreland Avenue, Conley, GA 30288
3528 Moreland Avenue, Conley, GA 30288
3526 Moreland Avenue, Conley, GA 30288
3527 Moreland Avenue, Conley, GA 30288
3526 Moreland Avenue, Conley, GA 30288
3527 Moreland Avenue, Conley, GA 30288
3527 Moreland Avenue, Conley, GA 30288
3526 Moreland Avenue, Conley, GA 30288
4004 Broadway Macon, Ga 31206

P.O. Box 485 Butler, GA 31006

4004 Broadway Macon, Ga 31206

4004 Broadway Macon, Ga 31206

P.O. Box 485 Butler, GA 31006

997 Milledgeville Road Eatonton,Ga 31024
4004 Broadway Macon, Ga 31206

4004 Broadway Macon, Ga 31206

1808 Lumpkin Rd., Augusta, Ga. 30906
1808 Lumpkin Rd., Augusta, Ga. 30906
1808 Lumpkin Rd., Augusta, Ga. 30906
1808 Lumpkin Rd., Augusta, Ga. 30906
1808 Lumpkin Rd., Augusta, Ga. 30906
1808 Lumpkin Rd., Augusta, Ga. 30906
3526 Moreland Avenue, Conley, GA 30288
P.O. Box 485 Butler, GA 31006

P.O. Box 485 Butler, GA 31006

P.O. Box 485 Butler, GA 31006

P.O. Box 485 Butler, GA 31006

P.O. Box 485 Butler, GA 31006

P.O. Box 485 Butler, GA 31006

P.O. Box 485 Butler, GA 31006

P.O. Box 485 Butler, GA 31006

716 North Street, West, Vidalia, Ga.30474
1808 Lumpkin Rd., Augusta, Ga. 30906
716 North Street, West, Vidalia, Ga.30474
1808 Lumpkin Rd., Augusta, Ga. 30906
406 Soperton Avenue East Dublin,Ga 31027
716 North Street, West, Vidalia, Ga.30474
1808 Lumpkin Rd., Augusta, Ga. 30906
716 North Street, West, Vidalia, Ga.30474
716 North Street, West, Vidalia, Ga.30474
716 North Street, West, Vidalia, Ga.30474
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Wheeler
Wilcox
Baker
Calhoun
Decatur
Dougherty
Grady
Lee
Miller
Mitchell
Seminole
Thomas
Atkinson
Berrien
Brantley
Charlton
Coffee
Cook
Irwin
Lowndes
Turner
Ware
Bryan
Bullock
Camden
Effingham
Glynn
Liberty
Long
Mcintosh
Chatham

Vidalia, Ga.
Vidalia, Ga.
Bainbridge, Ga
Bainbridge, Ga
Bainbridge, Ga
Bainbridge, Ga
Bainbridge, Ga
Bainbridge, Ga
Bainbridge, Ga
Bainbridge, Ga
Bainbridge, Ga
Bainbridge, Ga
Vidalia, Ga.
Vidalia, Ga.
Vidalia, Ga.
Vidalia, Ga.
Vidalia, Ga.
Vidalia, Ga.
Vidalia, Ga.
Vidalia, Ga.
Vidalia, Ga.
Vidalia, Ga.
Augusta, Ga.
Augusta, Ga.
Vidalia, Ga.
Augusta, Ga.
Vidalia, Ga.
Augusta, Ga.
Augusta, Ga.
Vidalia, Ga.
Augusta, Ga.

J. D. Bain
J. D. Bain
Stuart Shelton
Stuart Shelton
Stuart Shelton
Stuart Shelton
Stuart Shelton
Stuart Shelton
Stuart Shelton
Stuart Shelton
Stuart Shelton
Stuart Shelton
D. Bain
Bain
Bain
Bain
Bain
Bain
Bain
Bain

S

Bain
D. Bain
Marcin Grucela

T S

Marcin Grucela
J. D. Bain
Marcin Grucela
J. D. Bain
Marcin Grucela
Marcin Grucela
J. D. Bain
Marcin Grucela

800-992-4804
800-992-4804
205-288-0321
205-288-0321
205-288-0321
205-288-0321
205-288-0321
205-288-0321
205-288-0321
205-288-0321
205-288-0321
205-288-0321
800-992-4804
800-992-4804
800-992-4804
800-992-4804
800-992-4804
800-992-4804
800-992-4804
800-992-4804
800-992-4804
800-992-4804
800-282-1022
800-282-1022
800-992-4804
800-282-1022
800-992-4804
800-282-1022
800-282-1022
800-992-4804
800-282-1022

716 North Street, West, Vidalia, Ga.30474
716 North Street, West, Vidalia, Ga.30474
PO Box 430, Dalton, AL 36302

PO Box 430, Dalton, AL 36302

PO Box 430, Dalton, AL 36302

PO Box 430, Dalton, AL 36302

PO Box 430, Dalton, AL 36302

PO Box 430, Dalton, AL 36302

PO Box 430, Dalton, AL 36302

PO Box 430, Dalton, AL 36302

PO Box 430, Dalton, AL 36302

PO Box 430, Dalton, AL 36302

716 North Street, West, Vidalia, Ga.30474
716 North Street, West, Vidalia, Ga.30474
716 North Street, West, Vidalia, Ga.30474
716 North Street, West, Vidalia, Ga.30474
716 North Street, West, Vidalia, Ga.30474
716 North Street, West, Vidalia, Ga.30474
716 North Street, West, Vidalia, Ga.30474
716 North Street, West, Vidalia, Ga.30474
716 North Street, West, Vidalia, Ga.30474
716 North Street, West, Vidalia, Ga.30474
1808 Lumpkin Rd., Augusta, Ga. 30906
1808 Lumpkin Rd., Augusta, Ga. 30906
716 North Street, West, Vidalia, Ga.30474
1808 Lumpkin Rd., Augusta, Ga. 30906
716 North Street, West, Vidalia, Ga.30474
1808 Lumpkin Rd., Augusta, Ga. 30906
1808 Lumpkin Rd., Augusta, Ga. 30906
716 North Street, West, Vidalia, Ga.30474
1808 Lumpkin Rd., Augusta, Ga. 30906
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County

Haralson
Paulding
Walker

Habersham
Fayette

Carroll
Coweta
Heard
Meriwether
Troup

Baldwin
Monroe

Branch Location

Buchanan
Douglasville
Lafayette

Cleveland, Ga.
Newnan

Buchanan
Newnan

Buchanan
LaGrange
LaGrange

Newnan
Newnan

Blossman Gas Branches

Branch Manager

Traci Hill

Scott Weatherford

Gerald Cook

Jason Cantrel

Tim Crowe

Traci Hill

Tim Crowe
Traci Hill
Danny Swann
Danny Swann

Tim Crowe
Tim Crowe

Phone

(770) 646-5400
(770) 949-9815
(706) 638-2540

(706) 865-1797
(770) 253-4344

(770) 646-5400
(770) 253-4344
(770) 646-5400
(706) 882-7672
(706) 882-7672

(770) 253-4344
(770) 253-4344

Address

3081 Highway 27 Buchanan, Ga 30113
8905 Highway 5 Douglasville, Ga 30134
1725 North Main St. Lafayette, Ga 30728

2739 Highway 129 S Cleveland, Ga 30528
2635 East Hwy 16S Sharpsburg, Ga 30277

3081 Highway 27 Buchanan, Ga 30113
2635 East Hwy 16S Sharpsburg, Ga 30277
3081 Highway 27 Buchanan, Ga 30113
2876 West Point Rd. LaGrange, Ga 30240
2876 West Point Rd. LaGrange, Ga 30240

2635 East Hwy 16S Sharpsburg, Ga 30277
2635 East Hwy 16S Sharpsburg, Ga 30277



AmeriGas Branches

Region County Branch Phone Address
Location

2 Banks Commerce, GA | 706-335-5151 | 3048 Maysville Rd., Commerce, GA 30529
Gainesville, GA | 770-534-7391 | 1848 Thompson Bridge RD, Gainesville, GA 30501

2 Forsyth Gainesville, GA | 770-534-7391 | 1848 Thompson Bridge RD, Gainesville, GA 30501

2 Hall Gainesville, GA | 770-534-7391 | 1848 Thompson Bridge RD, Gainesville, GA 30501

2 Hart Hartwell, GA 706-376-3964 | 451 W. Howell St., Hartwell, GA 30643

2 Stephens Royston, GA 706-245-6161 | 1848 Thompson Bridge RD, Gainesville, GA 30501

3 Cherokee Canton, GA 770-479-5556 | 4195 Hickory Flat Hwy, Canton, GA 30115

3 Clayton McDonough, 770-914-8105 | 1660 S. Cedar St., McDonough, GA 30253
GA

3 Douglas Winston, GA 770-949-2116 | 8037 Bankhead Hwy, Winston, GA 30187

3 Henry McDonough, 770-914-8105 | 1660 S. Cedar St., McDonough, GA 30253
GA

3 Rockdale McDonough, 770-914-8105 | 1660 S. Cedar St., McDonough, GA 30253
GA

5 Greene Warner 478-953-3900 | 331S. Houston Lake Rd., Warner Robins, GA 31088
Robins, GA

7 Glascock Warner 478-953-3900 | 331S. Houston Lake Rd., Warner Robins, GA 31088
Robins, GA

7 Hancock Warner 478-953-3900 | 331S. Houston Lake Rd., Warner Robins, GA 31088
Robins, GA

7 Jefferson Warner 478-953-3900 | 331S. Houston Lake Rd., Warner Robins, GA 31088
Robins, GA

7 McDuffie Warner 478-953-3900 | 331S. Houston Lake Rd., Warner Robins, GA 31088
Robins, GA

7 Richmond Warner 478-953-3900 | 331S. Houston Lake Rd., Warner Robins, GA 31088
Robins, GA

7 Washington | Warner 478-953-3900 | 331S. Houston Lake Rd., Warner Robins, GA 31088
Robins, GA

7 Wilkes Warner 478-953-3900 | 331S. Houston Lake Rd., Warner Robins, GA 31088
Robins, GA

8 Clayton Hawkinsville, 478-892-9628 | 675 Commerce St., Hawkinsville, GA 31036
GA

8 Crisp Hawkinsville, 478-892-9628 | 675 Commerce St., Hawkinsville, GA 31036
GA

8 Dooly Hawkinsville, 478-892-9628 | 675 Commerce St., Hawkinsville, GA 31036
GA

8 Macon Hawkinsville, 478-892-9628 | 675 Commerce St., Hawkinsville, GA 31036
GA

8 Sumter Hawkinsville, 478-892-9628 | 675 Commerce St., Hawkinsville, GA 31036
GA

8 Talbot Hawkinsville, 478-892-9628 | 675 Commerce St., Hawkinsville, GA 31036

GA




8 Webster Hawkinsville, 478-892-9628 | 675 Commerce St., Hawkinsville, GA 31036
GA

9 Bleckley Hawkinsville, 478-892-9628 | 675 Commerce St., Hawkinsville, GA 31036
GA

9 Dodge Hawkinsville, 478-892-9628 | 675 Commerce St., Hawkinsville, GA 31036
GA

Jeff Davis McRae, GA 229-868-2721 | 501 E. Willow Creek Ln., McRae, GA 31055

9 Johnson Statesboro, GA | 912-681-6076 | 8951 US Hwy 301 South, Statesboro, GA 30458

9 Wayne Brunswick 912-265-8440 | 4182 Norwich St., Brunswick, GA 31520
Waycross 912-283-1177 | 1215 Albany Ave, Waycross, GA 31501
Hinesville, GA 912-876-3003 | 110 Devereaux Road, Hinesville, GA 31313

10 Colquitt Thomasville, 229-228-5252 | 16107 US 19 North, Thomas Ville GA 31792
GA

10 Early Thomasville, 229-228-5252 | 16107 US 19 North, Thomas Ville GA 31792
GA

10 Terrell Thomasville, 229-228-5252 | 16107 US 19 North, Thomas Ville GA 31792
GA

10 Worth Thomasville, 229-228-5252 | 16107 US 19 North, Thomas Ville GA 31792
GA

11 Ben Hill McRae, GA 229-868-2721 | 501 E. Willow Creek Ln., McRae, GA 31055

11 Brooks Valdosta, GA 229-244-9805 | 1815 S. Patterson St., Valdosta, GA 31610

11 Echols Valdosta, GA 229-244-9805 | 1815 S. Patterson St., Valdosta, GA 31610

11 Lanier Valdosta, GA 229-244-9805 | 1815 S. Patterson St., Valdosta, GA 31610

11 Pierce Waycross, GA 912-283-1177 | 1215 Albany Ave, Waycross, GA 31501

11 Tift Valdosta, GA 229-244-9805 | 1815 S. Patterson St., Valdosta, GA 31610




Ordering Instructions:

Locate the County for which to order Liquid Petroleum Gas from the Contract Mark-Up
Sheet.

Determine the appropriate Contractor for that County; contact the District Office for that
Vendor.

Refer to Contract Information Sheet for Contractor address and additional ordering
information.

Obtain appropriate Milner, Georgia price located on the Petroleum Weekly Report. This
report is updated and posted on Monday’s by 12:00 pm. Locate the mark-up per gallon
cost designated per County on the Contract Mark-up sheet. Add both prices together to find
cost per gallon.

Prepare Purchase Order or Order using your Purchasing Card



Statewide Contract No. SWC-90810, Liquified Petroleum Gas Price Sheet

Retail Delivery per

Bulk Delivery per

Region 1 gallon gallon Contractor
Bartow S 017 ] S 0.05 Ferrell Gas
Catoosa S 0.19 Ferrell Gas
Chattooga S 0.19 Ferrell Gas
Dade S 0.19 Ferrell Gas
Fannin S 0.17 Ferrell Gas
Floyd S 0.17 Ferrell Gas
Gilmer S 0.19 Ferrell Gas
Gordon S 0.19 Ferrell Gas
Haralson S 0.18 Blossman Gas
Murray S 0.17 Ferrell Gas
Paulding S 0.18 Blossman Gas
Pickens S 0.19 Ferrell Gas
Polk S 0.17 Ferrell Gas
Walker S 0.18 Blossman Gas
Whitfield S 0.19 Ferrell Gas
Region 2
Banks S 0.25 AmeriGas
Dawson S 0.18 Ferrell Gas
Forsyth S 0.25 AmeriGas
Franklin S 0.24 Ferrell Gas
Habersham S 0.19 Blossman Gas
Hall S 0.25 AmeriGas
Hart S 0.25 AmeriGas
Lumpkin S 0.17 Ferrell Gas
Rabun S 0.18| S Ferrell Gas
Stephens S 0.25 AmeriGas
Towns S 0.24 Ferrell Gas
Union S 017 S 0.05 Ferrell Gas
White S 0.18| S 0.05 Ferrell Gas
Region 3
Cherokee S 0.25 AmeriGas
Clayton S 0.25 AmeriGas
Cobb S 0.17 Ferrell Gas
Dekalb S 0.17 Ferrell Gas
Douglas S 0.25 AmeriGas
Fayette S 0.17 Blossman Gas
Fulton S 017 | S 0.05 Ferrell Gas
Gwinnett S 0.17 | S 0.05 Ferrell Gas
Henry S 0.25 AmeriGas
Rockdale S 0.25 AmeriGas
Region 4
Butts S 0.19 Ferrell Gas
Carroll S 0.18 Blossman Gas
Coweta S 0.18 Blossman Gas




Heard S 0.18 Blossman Gas
Lamar S 0.19 Ferrell Gas
Meriwether S 0.18 0.07 Blossman Gas
Pike S 0.19 Ferrell Gas
Spalding No Bid N/A
Troup S 0.18 Blossman Gas
Upson S 0.19 Ferrell Gas
Region 5

Barrow S 0.19 Ferrell Gas
Clarke S 0.19 Ferrell Gas
Elbert S 0.19 Ferrell Gas
Greene S 0.25 AmeriGas
Jackson No Bid N/A
Jasper S 0.19 Ferrell Gas
Madison No Bid No Bid N/A
Morgan S 0.19 0.05 Ferrell Gas
Newton S 0.23 Ferrell Gas
Oconee No Bid N/A
Oglethorpe S 0.24 Ferrell Gas
Walton S 0.24 Ferrell Gas
Region 6

Baldwin S 018 S 0.10 Blossman Gas
Bibb S 0.19 Ferrell Gas
Crawford S 0.21 Ferrell Gas
Houston S 0.19 Ferrell Gas
Jones S 0.22 Ferrell Gas
Monroe S 0.18 Blossman Gas
Peach S 0.21 Ferrell Gas
Pulaski No Bid N/A
Putnam S 0.18 Ferrell Gas
Twiggs S 0.22 Ferrell Gas
Wilkinson S 0.22 Ferrell Gas
Region 7

Burke S 0.19 Ferrell Gas
Columbia S 0.21 Ferrell Gas
Glascock S 0.25 AmeriGas
Hancock S 0.25 AmeriGas
Jefferson S 0.25 AmeriGas
Jenkins S 0.21 Ferrell Gas
Lincoln S 0.21 Ferrell Gas
McDuffie S 0.25 AmeriGas
Richmond S 0.25 AmeriGas
Screven S 0.23 Ferrell Gas
Taliafero S 0.19 Ferrell Gas
Warren No Bid N/A
Washington S 0.25 AmeriGas
Wilkes S 0.25 AmeriGas




Region 8

Chattahoochee S 0.19 Ferrell Gas
Clayton S 0.18 AmeriGas
Crisp S 0.25 AmeriGas
Dooly S 0.25 AmeriGas
Harris S 0.19 Ferrell Gas
Macon S 0.18 AmeriGas
Marion S 0.19 Ferrell Gas
Muscogee S 0.19 Ferrell Gas
Quitman S 0.23 Ferrell Gas
Randolph S 0.22 Ferrell Gas
Schley S 0.19 Ferrell Gas
Stewart S 0.19 Ferrell Gas
Sumter S 0.18 AmeriGas
Talbot S 0.25 AmeriGas
Taylor S 0.19 Ferrell Gas
Webster S 0.19 AmeriGas
Region 9

Appling S 0.20 Ferrell Gas
Bleckley S 0.25 AmeriGas
Candler S 0.23 Ferrell Gas
Dodge S 0.25 AmeriGas
Emanuel S 0.23 Ferrell Gas
Evans S 0.23 Ferrell Gas
Jeff Davis S 0.25 AmeriGas
Johnson S 0.25 AmeriGas
Laurens S 0.19 Ferrell Gas
Montgomery S 0.20 Ferrell Gas
Tattnall S 0.18| S 0.06 Ferrell Gas
Telfair S 0191 $ 0.05 Ferrell Gas
Toombs S 0.20 Ferrell Gas
Treutlen S 0.20 Ferrell Gas
Wayne S 0.18 | S 0.16 AmeriGas
Wheeler S 0191 $ 0.05 Ferrell Gas
Wilcox S 0191 $ 0.05 Ferrell Gas
Region 10

Baker S 0.19 Ferrell Gas
Calhoun S 0.19 Ferrell Gas
Colquitt S 0.18 AmeriGas
Decatur S 0.17 Ferrell Gas
Dougherty S 0.19 Ferrell Gas
Early S 0.25 AmeriGas
Grady S 0.19 Ferrell Gas
Lee S 0.19 Ferrell Gas
Miller S 0.19 Ferrell Gas
Mitchell S 0.19 Ferrell Gas
Seminole S 0.19 Ferrell Gas




AmeriGas

Ferrell Gas

AmeriGas

Ferrell Gas

N/A

AmeriGas

Ferrell Gas

Ferrell Gas

AmeriGas

Ferrell Gas

N/A

Ferrell Gas

Ferrell Gas

AmeriGas

Ferrell Gas

AmeriGas

Ferrell Gas

AmeriGas

AmeriGas

Ferrell Gas

Ferrell Gas

Ferrell Gas

Ferrell Gas

Ferrell Gas

Ferrell Gas

Ferrell Gas

Ferrell Gas

Ferrell Gas

Terrell S 0.25
Thomas S 0.19
Worth S 0.25
Region 11

Atkinson S 0.20
Bacon No Bid

Ben Hill S 0.25
Berrien S 0.20
Brantley S 0.20
Brooks S 0.25
Charlton S 0.20
Clinch No Bid

Coffee S 0.20
Cook S 0.20
Echols S 0.25
Irwin S 0.20
Lanier S 0.25
Lowndes S 0.20
Pierce S 0.25
Tift S 0.18
Turner S 0.20
Ware S 0.20
Region 12

Bryan S 0.23
Bullock S 0.23
Camden S 0.20
Chatham S 0.19
Effingham S 0.23
Glynn S 0.20
Liberty S 0.19
Long S 0.23
Mclntosh S 0.20

Ferrell Gas

Ferrell Gas




Ferrell Gas L.P.

7500 College Blvd. Suite 1000
Over Land Park, Kansas 66210

Garcia Vicki,

Tank size range

Unit Price/Month

Up to 120 gallon rental No Charge
121-250 gallon rental No Charge
251-500 gallon rental No Charge
501-1000 gallon rental No Charge
1001 and higher rental No Charge

Hourly Rate Unit Price/Hour
Maintenance rate 55.00
Installation rate No Charge

Tank Size Unit Price/Order
Fixed Surcharge for orders under
50 gallons (tank size is equal or
more than 100 gallons
g No Charge

Fixed Surcharge for orders under
50 gallons (tank size is up to 100
gallons)

No Charge




Amerigas Propane
460 N. Gulph Road
King of Prussia, PA 19406
Katrina Robinson, E-mail:
katrina.robinson@amerigas.com

Tank size range

Unit Price/Month

Up to 120 gallon rental S 6.00

121-250 gallon rental S 6.00

251-500 gallon rental S 6.00

501-1000 gallon rental S 8.00

1001 and higher rental S 8.00
Hourly Rate Unit Price/Hour

Maintenance rate S 75.00

Installation rate S 75.00

Tank Size Unit Price/Order

Fixed Surcharge for orders under

50 gallons (tank size is equal or

more than 100 gallons $ 50.00

Fixed Surcharge for orders under

50 gallons (tank size is up to 100

gallons) g 25,00




Blossman Gas, Inc.
809 Washington Avenue
Ocean Spring, MS 39564
Todd Reinke, E-mail: tmreinke@blossmangas.com

Tank size range

Unit Price/ Month

Up to 120 gallon rental S 1.00
121-250 gallon rental S 1.00
251-500 gallon rental S 1.00
501-1000 gallon rental S 1.00
1001 and higher rental S 1.00
Hourly Rate Unit Price/ Hour
Maintenance rate S 65.00
Installation rate S 65.00

Tank Size

Unit Price/ Order

Fixed Surcharge for orders under
50 gallons (tank size is equal or
more than 100 gallons

No Charge

Fixed Surcharge for orders under
50 gallons (tank size is up to 100
gallons)

5.00




Special Terms and Conditions:

1. Definitions

DOAS- Department of Administrative Services
The State- State of Georgia
LP Gas- Liquefied Petroleum Gas

Issuing Officer- Buyer’s contracting personnel.

Eligible User- All governmental agencies that have a physical presence in the State of Georgia as
well as any independent, not-profit college or university that is located in the State of Georgia.

Dealer- Any person who sells or offers to sell liquefi ed petroleum gas to an ulti mate consumer
for agricultural, industrial, commercial or domestic use.

Dispensing Operation: A dispensing facility or vehicle fuel di spenser as defined in NFPA 58
and used to dispense liquefied petroleum gas to the ultimate consumer.

Installation: The act of installing apparatus, piping, tubing, appliances, and equipment necessary
for storing and converting liquefied petroleum gas into flame for light, heat, cooling or power for
use by the ultimate consumer.

“Bulk” delivery- orders over 9,000 gallons

“Retail” delivery- orders up to 4,500 gallons

2. Period of Agreement

The initial term of the stat ewide contract is for two (2) calendar years from the execution date of
the contract. DOAS shall have four (4) one (1) year options to renew, which options shall be
exercisable at the sole discretion of DOAS.

3. Multiple Awards

Any contract award(s) resulting from the eRFQ will only be made to responsive and responsible
Bidder(s) meeting all specifications and with whom DOAS has reached agreement on all contract
terms and conditions. DOAS anticipates making contract award on a per count y basis to the
lowest responsive and responsible bid der per ¢ ounty; however, in the interests of coverage,
DOAS reserves the right to select one or more Bidders for award and to award all items to one or
more Bidders, individual line items to one or more Bidders, or counties/region s to one or m ore
Bidders when to do so is in the best interests of the State of Georgia.



Delivery terms

The “retail” and “bulk” orders shall be delivered within 48 hours after receipt of Purchase Order
Release. Failure to comply will result in cancellation of the contract. When ordered propane has
not been delivered within the term s and time frames specified herein, substitute propane may be
purchased from another supplier and the contractor will be responsible for paying any additional
acquisition costs. Habitual late or oth erwise non-complying deliveries shall be grou nds for
contract termination and recovery of damages.

The Vendor will not be held responsible for failu re to delivery caused directly by fire, fl ood,
strike, Acts of God, Act o f the Government, or any other circumstance which in the Division’s

opinion is beyond the control or fault of the Vendor.

Pumping and metering (including metered delivery tickets) are required for all deliveries.

Prospective bidders are expected to visit the various sites to determine if any special equipment or
procedure will be require d to properl y service the account. The submission ofa bi d will be
considered as conclusive evidence that the bidder has made such exam ination and/or is satisfied
as to the conditionsto  be encountered inth e performing of the work and fulfilli ng the
requirements of the contract.

The successful bidder(s) will be required to ¢ ontact the Agency to determine the hours the
Agency can accept deliveries.

Minimum Order Requirements for “retail” deliveries: Minimum order quantity under this contract
is 50 gallons for “retail” deliveries.

Minimum order quantity under this contract is 9,000 gallons for “bulk” deliveries.

“Retail” delivery- For orders less than 50 gallons, delivery charge of X dollars (Fixed surcharge is
requested in the price sheet) will be added to the invoice as a separate item in addition to the
amount of product delivered.

If the facility is on “keep full progra m” the requirement for fixed surcharge must be waived,
customer is not responsible for any additional charges.

Delivery Completion: delivery shall be considered completed only when propane has been
shipped FOB Destination and placed into the purchaser’s propane tank(s).

Routine Deliveries: for routine orders placed by the purchaser, the contractor shall schedule
deliveries during normal working hours within a guaranteed maximum of three (3) calendar
days after receipt of order. However, on a case-by -case basis for re mote delivery locations,
the purchaser and contractor may agree on a later delivery time.

“Keep Full Program” Deliveries: purchasers may request to par ticipate in the contractor’ s
“Keep Full Program” if the contractor has such a program for their other cust omers. Under
this program, contractor shall schedule deliveries at its convenie nce as authorized b y the
purchaser. Further, contractor guarantees that “Keep Full Progra m” customers will not run
out of propane. Ifthey should run out, contractor agrees to make a delivery as quickl y as



possible, but not later than twenty-four (24) hours. The bid margin will remain the same fo r
this service.

Emergency Deliveries: should an e mergency situation arise, the contractor guarantees
delivery within a maximum of twenty four ( 24) hours after no tifications of need or as
required by the purchase r in response to an  emergency. The Contractor may charge a
reasonable service charge for such deliveries in addition to norm al product charges and bid
margins, based on the nature of the emergency and the extent of additional costs incurred.
The State re serves the right to approve additi onal charges before the order is process ed.
Supplier must get the approval of the State before delivering the order.

Tank installation and maintenance

Bidder(s) are required to sub mit hourly labor rates for installation and maintenance as
requested in the Price Sheet. Through this contract, purchaser may request that the contractor
provide: delivery of propane storage t ank(s), assistance with the installation of a purchase r
owned tanks(s), tank installation and set-up, n ecessary permits or fees, parts, supplies and
piping. For some new installations, contractors may also be asked to provide concrete base
slabs on which to set propane storage tanks, ¢ oncrete slab and storage tank delivery and set-
up services, trenching services, pipe installation services, pressure  regulators and concrete
filled bollards. For evaluation pur poses, bidders are required to submit hourly maintenance
and installation rates onl y. Cost of a dditional supplies and pa rts will be rei mbursed by
customer upon inspection of invoices subm itted by supplier. No ad ministrative mark up on
parts and supplies will be provided; bidders must factor administrative costs into submitted
hourly rates. All supplied equipment and services must comply with established federal, state
and local co des and regu lations. A co py of the applicable equipment or the company’s
warranty shall also be furnished at the time services or equipment is provided.

Tank rental

Contractors must have propane tanks available on a rental basis. Contractor’s monthly rental
rates are requested in the Price Sheet and will be fixed throughout the term o f the contract,
rental rates are subject to revision up on contractor’s request at the time of contract renew al,
the State reserves the right to evaluate and negotiate any rate increase requests. Contractor
may ask purchaser to sign their standard rental agreement, provided the re sultant agreement
does not have any conflicts with the Georgia Statewide Contract.

Tank rental fees are reque sted inthe Non-Core Price Sheet tab of the eRFQ Price Shee t
worksheet. Quantity column represents the nu mber of Vendor Owned ta nks at various State
locations. Quantities reflect the number of tanks that are expected to be rented by the State
Agencies and are not guaranteed quantities. Quantities of tanks are based on the num ber of
currently rented tanks.



7. Tank removal

The appropriate State Agency will coordinate the removal of Vendor Owned Tanks (VOT) a s
necessary. Vendor shall cooperate with the Agency in the removal of tank and shall requir e not
more than 72 hours following notificati on for removal. In those i nstances when Vendor Owned
Tanks must be removed due to contract awar d to another Vendor, the Agency may (at its
discretion) continue to rent the tank at the rate provided by contract until the remaining fuel is
used or electto have the tank rem oved with the remaining Liquid Petroleum Gas. The new
Vendor will be responsible for supplying another Vendor Owned Tanks at the quoted rental price.
If the Vendor Owned Tanks are removed prior to using all the Liquid Petroleum Gas, the Vendor

shall provide a credit based upon the last delivered price and the remaining Liquid Petroleum Gas
in the tank. In either case, no rental charges will be paid beyond three (3) working days following
notification to pick up.

Vendors shall comply with the Department of Tr ansportation, Federal Highway Administration,
Bureau of Motor Carrier Safety, Code of Federal Regulations Title 49, parts 100 through 199 and
parts 390 through 397. Further, the Vendor shall ensure that any other applicable law, regulation,
ordinance and the contract specifications are followed in the removal of Vendor Owned Tanks,
delivery of Vendor Owned Tanks and delivery of Liquid Petroleum Gas.

8. Commodity Pricing and Invoices

a. The contractor’s delivery receipt is to be signed by purchaser’s representative at time of delivery.
In rare instances, when the delivery  driver is unable to locate the purchaser’ s representative,
he/she may write “no one available to sign” on delivery receipt and sign it themselves.

basis with adjustments becoming effective at 12:01 A.M. each Monday. The price paid per gallon
for Liquefied Petroleum Gas will incr ease or decrease on a weekl y basis based on the previous
week’s average price per gallon at the Milner, Georgia ter minal as printed on the OPIS Re ports.
The price used will be based on Monday through  Friday weekly average reading obtained on
following Monday between hours of 8:00 A.M. and 12:00 PM. The weekly average price used for
payment will be based on the date of delivery.

c. The contractor shall prepare and submit an invoice to the purchaser for each delivery (or monthly
if requested by purchaser).

d. Prices/taxes (typical invoice):

Product price (average OPIS weekly price at the Milner, GA terminal)  $. /gallon
Mark up Margin: $. /gallon

Federal Excise Tax (1): % added

Pricing shall be established on the “DAY OF DELIVERY”. Fuel prices will be adjusted on a weekly



10.

11.

State and Local Sales Tax (2): Exempt

Invoice Total: $

Price Sheet and Awards:

Price sheet responses shall be subm itted in the locations and formats provided in the Price Sheet
in Section 5 of eRFQ document. Bidder must submit bids for a minimum number of three (3 )
counties within any region. The Firm Markup or Discount must include th e vendor’s profit,
delivery costs, vendor surcharge fee, and any other costs the vendor wishes to include except to
the extent the cost worksheet speci fically requests that the cost be identified separately . “Retail”
delivery mark up margin/Discount per gallon shall be submitted for each county, bidder(s) must
submit both “retail” and “bulk” delivery mark up/discount bids for requested counties (Only
select counties require “retail” and “bulk” delivery rates). Failure to provide “bulk” and “retail”
delivery rates for select counties will result in disqualification of bidder for that county.

The State will use only Core Price Sheet to evaluate bids, Non Core price sheet will not be used
in the evaluations. The State reserves th e right not to award Non Core Price sheet components if
they are found to be non-competitive or unreasonable.

Prices shall be per gallon for the Firm Markup or Discount to the Milner, GA ter minal weekly
average. The Firm Markup or Discount shall not change during the term of the contract. The
average weekly price for Milner, GA shall be used as a ba sis for prices u nder this contract
regardless of where the gas is purchased.

For the sole purpose of enabling the  State to eval uate all bids consistently , the OPIS weekly
average for June 15, 2009 will be used to evaluate the total proposed prices per gallon, including
the mark up margin/discounts.

Fuel Surcharge Usage.

Fuel surcharge will be ef fective if and when the price of diesel fuel exceeds $3.50. Surcharge
amount is calculated based on the n umber of stops per delivery. Surcharge am ount per stop is
$2.00. Each customer will pay a surcharge for a stop at its location only. Number of stops and
surcharge amount shall be indicated as a separate line on all invoices received by customers.

Diesel fuel price is OPIS weekly average price and posted by DOAS on weekly basis, supplier
must use weekly average prices posted by DOAS in calculating surcharge fees.

Product specifications:



Propane shall meet the HD5-ASTM Specifications.

Propane HD 5 shall be a special propane for motor fuel and other uses requiring more restrictive
specifications than Commercial Propane and shall conform to the following specifications:

VAPOR PRESSURES- The vapor pressure at 10 0°F as deter mined by NPGA LPG V apor
Pressure Test shall not be more than 200 pounds per square inch gage pressure.

95% BOILING POINT - Thetem perature at which 95% of volum e of the produ ct has
evaporated shall be -37°F or 1 ower when corrected to a barom etric pressure of 760mm Hg., as
determined by the NPGA Weathering Test for Liquefied Petroleum Gases.

RESIDUE- The product shall pass the non-volatile residue test and shall pass the oil ring test -
each as deter mined by the NPGA Method for Determining Residues in Liquefied Petroleu m
Gases.

VOLATILE SULFUR- The unstenched product shall not co ntain volatile sulfur in excess of 10
grains per hundred cubic feet as determined by NPGA Volatile Sulfur Test.

CORROSIVE COMPOUNDS- The product shall cause no more discoloration to  a polished
copper test strip when su ch product is subjected to the NPGA LPG Corrosion Test than the

discoloration of Standard copper strip Classification 1, as described in ASTM Method D 130-56,
Table I, Copper Strip Corrosion by Petroleum Products.

DRYNESS-The product shall not contain free, entrained water.

COMPOSITION- The propylene content of the product shall not exceed 5 liquid volume percent
and the product shall contain a minimum of 90 liquid percent of propane.



Contract Renewals/Extensions/Changes

1. Renewal:
Effective Date of this Renewal Notice: July 16, 2012
Initial Effective Date of Contracts: July 15, 2009
Expiration Date: July 15, 2013
All  contracts have been renewed for an additional year with all

three (3) suppliers, at the same prices, terms and conditions.
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           Contract Renewals/Extensions/Changes
1. Renewal:
   Effective Date of this Renewal Notice:     July 16, 2012
   Initial Effective Date of Contracts:       July 15, 2009
   Expiration Date:                           July 15, 2013
   All contracts have been renewed for an additional year with all
   three (3) suppliers, at the same prices, terms and conditions.
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CONTRACT AMENDMENT

This amendment by and between the Contractor and State Entity defined below shall be effective as of
the date this Amendment is fully executed.

State Entity’s Name: | DOAS

Contractor’s Full Legal | AmeriGas Propane
Name: :

Contract No.: | SWC90810

Solicitation No./Event ID: | 99999-SPD-0000017

Solicitation Title/Event | Liquid Petroleum Gas
Name:

Contract Award Date: | 07/15/2009

Current Contract Term: | 07/15/2011 to 07/15/2012

WHEREAS, the Contract is in effect through the Current Contract Term as defined above; and

NOW THEREFORE, for good and valuable consideration, the receipt and sufficiency of which are hereby
acknowledged, the parties do hereby agree as follows:

1. This contract has been renewed through 07/15/2013. All terms, conditions and prices of the
contract will remain the same and is accepted as herein amended.

2. SUCCESSORS AND ASSIGNS. This Amendment shall be binding upon and inure to the
benefit of the successors and permitted assigns of the parties hereto.

3. ENTIRE AGREEMENT. Except as expressly modified by this Amendment, the contract shall
be and remain in full force and effect in accordance with its terms and shall constitute the
legal, valid, binding and enforceable obligations to the parties. This Amendment and the
contract (including any written amendments thereto), collectively, are the complete agreement
of the parties and supersede any prior agreements or representations, whether oral or written,
with respect thereto.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties have caused this Amendment to be duly executed by their
authorized re_presentatives.

Signature Page to Follow

21111 ' SPD-CP013





CONTRACTOR

Contractor’s Full Legal Name:
(PLEASE TYPE OR PRINT)

AmeriGas Propane

Authorized Signature:

bt (L

Printed Name and Title of Person

Do tRw g, YevToN

Signing: | VvicE TLOH 1oV
Date: ?, l‘il V-
Company Address: | AmeriGas Propane, LP

460 N. Gulph Road
King of Prussia, PA 19406

STATE ENTITY

s

Authorized Signature:

nah nneds P

Printed Name and Title of Person

Carol Kennedy-Sims g
Category Manager - Plrchasing

Signing:
Date: 3%26’// A—
Company Address: | 200 Piedmont Avenue, S.E.

Suite 1302, West Tower
Atlanta, GA. 30334-9010

21111

2 SPD-CP013
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Georgia

CONTRACT AMENDMENT

This amendment by and between the Contractor and State Entity defined below shall be effective as of
the date this Amendment is fully executed.

STATE OF GEORGIA CONTRACT

State Entity’s Name: | DOAS

Contractor's Fuil Legal | Ferreligas, L.P.
Name:

Contract No.: | SWCH0810

Solicitation No./Event ID: | 29989-SPD-0000017

Solicitation Title/Event | Liquid Petroleum Gas
Name:

Contract Award Date: | 07/15/2009

Current Contract Term: | 07/15/2011 16 07/15/2012

WHEREAS, the Contract is in effect through the Current Contract Term as defined above; and

NOW THEREFORE, for good and valuable consideration, the receipt and sufficiency of which are hereby
acknowledged, the parties do hereby agree as follows:

1. This contract has been renewed through 07/15/2013. Ali terms, conditions and prices of the
contract will remain the same and is accepted as herein amended,

2. SUCCESSORS AND ASSIGNS. This Amendment shali be binding upon and Inure to the
benefit of the successors and permitted assigns of the parties hereto,

3. ENT!RE AGREEMENT. Except as expressly modified by this Amendment, the contract shall
be and remain in full force and effect in accordance with its terms and shall constitute the
legal, valid, binding and enforceable obligations o the parties. This Amendment and the
eontract (including any written amendments thereto), collectively, are the complete agreement
of the parties and supersede any prior agreements or representations, whether oral or written,
with respect thereto.

IN WITNESS WHEREQF, the parties have caused this Amendment fo be duly executed by their
authorized representatives.

Signature Page to Foliow
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CONTRACTOR

Contractor's Full Legal Name:
(PLEASE TYPE OR PRINT)

Feireligas, L.P.

Authorized Signature:

Printed Nams and Title of Person
Signing:

Ko, T Tloloh

, R
Kiq.“d J ﬁbalslﬂ /Gz.de,m,l /‘\m«chm‘

Date:

0314143

Company Address:

Ferreligas, L.P.
7500 College Blvd., Suite 1000
Qverland Park, KS 66210

STATE ENTITY

Authorized Signature:

Mﬁm&é—p‘z&

Printed Name and Title of Person
Signing:

Carol Kennedy-Sims
Category Manager - Purchasing

Date:

3/14/12-

Company Address:

200 Piedmont Avenue, S.E.
Suite 1302, West Tower
Atlanta, GA. 30334-8010

211111
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Georgia

CONTRACT AMENDMENT

This amendment by and between the Contractor and State Entity defined below shall be effective as of
the date this Amendment is fully executed.

STATE OF GEORGIA CONTRACT

State Entity’s Name: | DOAS

Contractor’s Full Legal | Blossman Gas, Inc.
Name:

Contract No.: | SWC90810

Solicitation No./Event ID: | 99999-SPD-0000017

Solicitation Title/Event | Liquid Petroleum Gas
Name:

Contract Award Date: | 07/15/2009

Current Contract Term: | 07/15/2011 to 07/15/2012

WHEREAS, the Contract is in effect through the Current Contract Term as defined above; and

NOW THEREFORE, for good and valuable consideration, the receipt and sufficiency of which are hereby
acknowledged, the parties do hereby agree as follows:

1. This contract has been renewed through 07/15/2013. All terms, conditions and prices of the
contract will remain the same and is accepted as herein amended.

2. SUCCESSORS AND ASSIGNS. This Amendment shall be binding upon and inure to the
benefit of the successors and permitted assigns of the parties hereto.

3 ENTIRE AGREEMENT. Except as expressly modified by this Amendment, the contract shall
be and remain in full force and effect in accordance with its terms and shall constitute the
legal, valid, binding and enforceable obligations to the parties. This Amendment and the
contract (including any written amendments thereto), collectively, are the complete agreement
of the parties and supersede any prior agreements or representations, whether oral or written,
with respect thereto.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties have caused this Amendment to be duly executed by their
authorized representatives.

Signature Page to Follow
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CONTRACTOR

Contractor’s Full Legal Name:
(PLEASE TYPE OR PRINT)

Blossman Gas, Inc.

Authorized Signature:

O,

Printed Name and Title of Person
Signing:

ok - LB ke
V.2, Hi

Date:

S/IS‘/JL

Company Address:

Blossman Gas, Inc.
809 Washington Avenue
Ocean Springs, MS 39564

STATE ENTITY

Authorized Signature:

Crad Soas o

Printed Name and Title of Person

Carol Kennedy-Sims (/
Category Manager - Purchasing

Signing:
pate: | 3/15/12
Company Address: | 200 Piedmont Avenue, S.E.

Suite 1302, West Tower
Atlanta, GA. 30334-9010

211111

SPD-CP013








